16-15APR26 - METAL CULVERT PIPE

BID TABULATION

4.8. Annular Riveted 16 GA. 10 GA.
Corrugated Metal 10 GA. Poly |12 GA. Poly| 14 GA. Poly | 16 GA. Poly | 10 GA. Zinc| 12 GA. Zinc | 14 GA. Zinc Zinc Alum
Pipe Coated Coated Coated Coated Coated Coated Coated Coated Coated
481. |12"LF. 111.16 No Bid NoBid | $ 2220]|% 17.71 No Bid NoBid | $ 19.04|$ 1513 No Bid
12" Band 222.32 $ a4s8|s 3542 s 3808| $3026
482. |24” wide ' No Bid No Bid ' ‘ No Bid No Bid ' ‘ No Bid
4.8.3. 15” L.F. 140.47 No Bid NoBid | > 2826[5 2229 No Bid NoBid | ® 24145 19.04 No Bid
15" Band 280.94 $ 5652|¢ aass $ 4828 S 3808
4.8.4. 24” wide ) No Bid No Bid ) ) No Bid No Bid ) ) No Bid
485. |18”LF. 166.45 No Bid NoBid | 3343|$ 2647 No Bid NoBid | 2856|$ 22.61 No Bid
18" Band 332.90 $ 6686|$ 5294 ¢ s5712| ¢ 4522
4.8.6. |24” wide No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
4.8.7. 24” LF. 22231 No Bid NoBid | S 44.58|S 3542 No Bid NoBid | S 38.08| S 3026 No Bid
24" Band 444.62 $ 8916|$ 7084 $ 7616 $ 6052
4.8.8. 24” wide ) No Bid No Bid ) ) No Bid No Bid ) ) No Bid
189 |30"LE 486.08 NoBid| S 768L|$ 5473($  43.38 Nomid | S 6562|$ 4675 37.06 No Bid
30" Band 972.16 $ 15362 (S 109.46|$  86.76 $ 13124|$ 9350 S 74.12
4.8.10. |24” wide ' No Bid ‘ ' ‘ No Bid ‘ ' ‘ No Bid
36" Band 1,159.08 $ 183.08|$ 13054|$ 10348 $ 15640 |$ 11152 | ¢ 88.40
4.8.12 24” wide e No Bid ) ) ) No Bid ) ) ) No Bid
36"Band | . o o004 $ 54924 |$ 391.62|% 31044 $ 46920 |$ 33456 | $ 265.20
4.8.13. 48” wide T No Bid ) ) ) No Bid ) ) ) No Bid
as1a oz LE 890.89 | ¢ 13691 $ 10726 |$ 76.42 Nomig | S 11696[$ 9163|s es28| .. |$ 12659
42" Band 1,781.78 | ¢ 27382 $ 21452|$ 15284 $ 233.92|¢ 18326 % 130.56 $ 253.18
4.8.15. |24” wide S ‘ ‘ ' No Bid ' ‘ ' No Bid '




42” Band

sste  lagwme | § 5:39534|S 82146| s 643563 45852 Nomg | S 70176 |$ 54978 so168| o |$ 75954
2817, lagrip | $ 101532|$ 15602|$ 122193 8716 o | $ 13328|$ 10438 7a46| o |$ 14426
48"Band | o, oeals 31204 244388 17432 $ 26656 ¢ 208.76 148.92 $ 28852
4.8.18. [24” wide A0S0 : : ' No Bid ' : : No Bid '
48"Band | o 00190 |s 93612 ¢ 733148 522.96 $ 79968 |¢$ 62628 446.76 $ 865.56
4.8.19. |a8” wide A2 : : ' No Bid ' : : No Bid '
a820. |sarip | S 115744|$ 17791|$ 13930($ 99.30 Nogig | § 151.98[$ 119.00 8483 | Nopiq|S 164.50
>4"Band | . ) 314888 355.82| ¢ 27860|% 198.60 $ 303.96|$ 238.00 169.66 $ 329.00
4.8.21. 24” wide e ’ ) ) No Bid ) ’ ) No Bid )
>4"Band | . o464 $1067.46| ¢ 835.80|¢ 595.80 $ 71188 |$  714.00 508.98 $ 987.00
4.8.22. 48” wide o e ) ) No Bid ) ’ ) No Bid )
60"Band | o o o644 8117612 | ¢ 92058 $100472|$ 786.42 $1,087.44
4.8.24. 48” wide e T ) No Bid No Bid . ) No Bid No Bid e
1825 les”Lp. | S 106507 |$ 21492|$ 16835 No Bid Nogid | § 18360 S 14382 nogid | nogig|$ 19872
66”Band | . ¢ 35042 | ¢1289.52 | $1,010.10 $1101.60 | $ 862.92 $1192.32
4.8.26. |a8” wide 20 287 e No Bid NoBid [~ : NoBid| NoBid|” "%
72°Band | o o o0n 36| ¢ 140412 | $1,109.22 $119952 |$ 947.58 $ 129828
4.8.28. 48” wide e T e No Bid No Bid e ) No Bid No Bid e
4.829. |78”LF | 70453|5 25353 No Bid No Bid NoBid | > 216-58 No Bid NoBid| Nogid|® 23442
78" Band | ¢ 477718 $1,521.18 $1,299.48 51,406.52
4.830. |a8” wide No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NoBid | No Bid
84" LF.
283l la $ 246324 (¢ 31796 ¢ 24867 177.33 14350 | $ 271.43|$ 21228 15138 | $ 12250 | $ 293.14
84” Band
3x148” | $14779.44 | $1,907.76 | $1,492.02 | $1,063.98 861.00 | $1,628.58 | $1,273.68 908.28 | ¢ 735.00 | $ 1,758.84
4.832. |wide




4.8.33.

90” L.F.
3x1

S 2,636.18

S 340.30

S 266.30

S 189.83

S 153.34

S 290.50

S 22733

S 162.05

$ 130.90

S 313.74

4.8.34,

90” L.F.
3x1

$15,814.16

$2,041.88

$1,597.80

$1,130.98

S 920.04

$1,743.00

$1,363.98

S 977.30

S 785.40

$1,882.44

4.8.35.

96” Band
3x1

S 2,809.18

S 362.65

S 283.72

S 202.34

S 163.39

S 309.58

S 242.20

S 172.73

$ 139.48

S 334.34

4.8.36.

96” Band
3x148”
wide

$16,855.08

$2,175.90

$1,702.32

$1,214.04

S 980.34

$1,857.48

$1,453.20

$ 836.88

$2,006.04

4.8.37.

102” L.F.
3x1

$ 3,002.07

S 38376

S 301.97

S 22181

S 174.05

S 327.60

S 257.78

S 189.35

$ 148.58

$ 353.81

4.8.38.

102” Band
3x1 48"
wide

$18,012.42

$2,302.56

$1,811.82

$1,330.86

$1,044.30

$1,965.60

$1,546.68

$1,136.10

S 891.48

$2,122.86

4.8.39.

108” L.F.
3x1

S 2,631.09

S 383.76

S 301.97

S 22181

No Bid

S 346.85

S 271.43

S 210.35

No Bid

S 374.60

4.8.40.

108” Band
3x1 48"
wide

$15,786.54

$2,302.56

$1,811.82

$1,330.86

No Bid

$2,081.10

$1,628.58

$1,262.10

No Bid

$2,247.60

4.8.41.

114” L.F.
3x1

S 2,883.71

S 428.66

S 336.41

S 273.88

No Bid

$ 365.93

S 287.18

S 233.80

No Bid

$ 395.20

4.8.42,

114” Band
3x1 48"
wide

$17,302.26

$2,571.96

$2,018.46

$1,643.28

No Bid

$2,195.58

$1,723.08

$1,402.80

No Bid

$2,371.20

4.8.43,

120” L.F.
3x1

S 2,231.06

S 451.00

S 352.81

No Bid

No Bid

S 385.00

S 301.18

No Bid

No Bid

S 415.80

4.8.44.

120” Band
3x1 48"
wide

$13,386.36

$2,706.00

$2,116.86

No Bid

No Bid

$2,310.00

$1,807.08

No Bid

No Bid

$2,494.80

4.8.45.

126" L.F.
3x1

$ 1,392.00

$ 501.51

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

S 428.12

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

S 462.37

4.8.46.

126” Band
3x1 48"
wide

S 8,352.00

$ 3,009.06

No Bid

No Bid

$2,568.72

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$2,774.22




132" L.F.

4.8.47. 3x1 > 1458825 52559 No Bid No Bid No Bid > 44867 No Bid No Bid No Bid > 48456
132” Band
3x1 48" S 8,752.92 | $3,153.54 $2,692.02 $2,907.36
4.8.48. wide No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1387 L.F. $ 1,524.47 S 549.24 $ 468.86 $ 506.37
4.8.49. 3x1 e ' No Bid No Bid No Bid ' No Bid No Bid No Bid '
138” Band
3x1 48" S 9,146.82 | $3,295.44 $2,813.16 $3,038.22
4.8.50. wide No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
144" L.F.
4.8.51. 3x1 > 1,590.03 |5 57285 No Bid No Bid No Bid > 48903 No Bid No Bid No Bid > 52815
144” Band
3x1 48" S 9,540.18 | $3,437.10 $2,934.18 $3,168.90
4.8.52. wide No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Lifting
Lugs per
4.8.53. set S 100.00
Arching
4.8.54. Fee % 8%
COOP? (YES OR NO) YES




14 GA.

12 GA. Alum Alum
Coated Coated

NoBid | S 20.61
41.22

No Bid >
NoBid | > 2613
52.26

No Bid 2
NoBid | » 3091
S 61.82

No Bid

No Bid S  41.22
82.44

No Bid 2
S 71.02 | $§ 50.60
S 142.04| $ 101.20
S 8464 | S 60.35
S 169.28 ( S 120.70
S 507.84 (S 362.10
S 99.18| S 70.66
S 19836 | S 141.32




595.08

S 423.96

112.98

S 80.59

225.96

S 161.18

677.88

S 483.54

128.80

S 91.82

257.60

S 183.64

772.80

$ 550.92

141.86

No Bid

851.16

No Bid

155.66

No Bid

$

933.96

No Bid

S

170.94

No Bid

$ 1,025.64

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$

229.26

S 163.49

$ 1,375.56

S 980.94




$ 24551 | $ 175.01
$ 1,473.06 | $1,050.06
$ 261.58| $ 186.54
$ 1,569.48 | $1,119.24
S 278.40| $ 204.50
$ 1,670.40 | $1,227.00
$ 293.14| S 227.18
$ 1,758.84 | $1,363.08
$ 310.15| $ 252.50
$ 1,860.90 | $1,515.00
325.27
? No Bid
$ 1,951.62
No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid




No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid




	Sheet2

